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Mi sono chiesto che effetto avrebbe fatto scrivere dopo o mentre mi nutrivo di immagini, pitture o intere
mostre.
Mi domandavo come il contatto con un'altra forma d'arte influenzasse la formazione delle parole in poesia,
figurandomi lo sviluppo di una farfalla nella pupa. Imago è la fase finale di questo processo, quando la
farfalla è ormai pressoché pronta ad abbandonare il bozzolo. Questi "incontri" sono stati casuali e il contatto
con l'opera di questi autori influenza lo stile di un organismo totalmente nuovo e diverso, facilitando
l'apertura di bocche nascoste del "vulcano". Questa esperienza mi ha portato a vivere, e ciò che di solito si
immagina attraverso il racconto, in un aumento vertiginoso di tensione espositiva. Tutto ciò stimola le corde
di una più vasta immaginazione che comprende la memoria e il presente con tutto ciò che avviene attorno,
nei luoghi in cui scrivo.
Il risultato è "IMAGO", un esperimento che da origine ad una nuova collana di poesia.

Nel volume è compresa la rubrica Circolo Aperto dei Nomadismi Alfanumerici.
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From reader reviews:

Alice Scales:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Imago (Italian Edition). All
type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Shirley Eagle:

This Imago (Italian Edition) are reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
reason of this Imago (Italian Edition) can be one of several great books you must have is giving you more
than just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that might be will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions
in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this Imago (Italian Edition) forcing you to have an enormous of
experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your
day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Nathaniel Mitchell:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled Imago (Italian Edition) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect
that maybe not known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in
a guide then become one web form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The
Imago (Italian Edition) giving you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also
giving you useful information for your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern
the following is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like
winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

David Moore:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that
you have read. If you need to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The Imago
(Italian Edition) provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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